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Authority: Title 33.1, Code of Virginia. 
 
A.1.  Included in the amount for ground transportation system planning and research is $4,000,000 the first year
and $4,000,000 the second year from the highway share of the Transportation Trust Fund for the planning and
evaluation of options to address transportation needs. Such funds shall be used, but are not limited to, the
completion of activities prior to the initiation of an individual project's design or to benefit identification of needs
throughout the state or the prioritization of those needs. For federally eligible activities, the activity or item shall
be included in the Commonwealth Transportation Board's annual update of the Six-Year Improvement program so
that 1) appropriate federal funds may be allocated and reimbursed for the activities and 2) all requirements of the
federal Statewide Transportation Improvement Program can be achieved. Such planning and evaluation may be
conducted or managed by the Department of Transportation, Department of Rail and Public Transportation, or
another qualified entity selected and/or approved by the Commonwealth Transportation Board. 
 
2.  For the allocation of funds under this paragraph for projects in micropolitan or metropolitan areas, as defined
by the federal Office of Management and Budget, east of or adjacent to Route 29, priority shall be given to those
local governments that complete a build-out analysis of their comprehensive plans and zoning. 
 
a.  The build-out analysis shall include the total number of housing units and commercial development,
transportation infrastructure needed to support that development, and the estimated cost of transportation
infrastructure.  If requested, the Department shall provide technical assistance for the analysis. 
 
b.  The build-out report will be shared with the Regional Planning District Commissions (RC or PDC), Metropolitan
Planning Organizations (MPO), and the Virginia Department of Transportation (VDOT). 
 
B. Out of the amounts provided for Ground Transportation System Planning and Research, the Department of
Transportation, through the Virginia Transportation Research Council, shall allocate such amounts as may be
required to study the use of soil stabilizers in highway shoulders at one or more selected locations. In conducting
its evaluation, the Council shall include a cost/benefit analysis, with the objective of finding a method of
substantially reducing the occurrence of pavement/shoulder drop-off at a reasonable cost. Findings of the
evaluation shall be reported to the Chairmen of the House Appropriations and Senate Finance Committees no later
than January 1, 2005. 
 

VIRGINIA STATE BUDGET

Item 487 (Not set out) First Year - FY2005 Second Year - FY2006

Ground Transportation System Planning and Research (60200) $24,115,093 $27,848,051

Ground Transportation System Planning (60201) $20,938,670 $22,894,902

Ground Transportation System Research (60202) $3,176,423 $4,953,149

Fund Sources:

Commonwealth Transportation $24,115,093 $27,848,051



C. Out of the appropriation included for this item, $75,000 in the first year shall be provided to fund the costs of
engineering services required to continue efforts to select appropriate traffic calming methods for the Hunter Mill
Road area in Fairfax County. VDOT shall transfer such funds to the Northern Virginia Transportation Authority
which shall be responsible for ensuring the conduct of the traffic calming study. The Northern Virginia
Transportation Authority shall present the findings and recommendations of the engineering review to the
Governor and the Chairmen of the Senate Finance and House Appropriations Committees by December 15, 2004. 
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